
DRUG MISUSE AND TRAFFICKING (AMENDMENT) ACT 
1988 No. 17 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 

1. Short title 
2. Commencement 
3. Meaning of "Principal Act" 
4. Amendment of Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 No. 226 
5. Operation of amendments 
SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 



DRUG MISUSE AND TRAFFICKING (AMENDMENT) ACT 1988 
No. 17 

NEW SOUTH WALES 

Act No. 17, 1988 

An Act to amend the Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 with respect 
to the categories of prohibited plants and drugs under that Act, to increase 
penalties for certain offences and for other purposes. [Assented to 21 June 
1988] 



2 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

The Legislature of New South Wales enacts: 

Short title 

1. This Act may be cited as the Drug Misuse and Trafficking 
(Amendment) Act 1988. 

Commencement 

2. This Act commences on a day or days to be appointed by 
proclamation. 

Meaning of "Principal Act" 

3. The Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 is referred to in this Act 
as the Principal Act. 

Amendment of Drug Misuse and Trafficking Act 1985 No. 226 

4. The Principal Act is amended as set out in Schedule 1. 

Operation of amendments 

5. (1) An amendment made to the Principal Act by this Act does 
not apply to an offence alleged to have been committed before 
the commencement of the amendment, except as provided by 
subsection (2). 

(2) Section 43 (Certificate evidence) of the Principal Act, as amended by 
this Act, applies to the production of a certificate under that section after 
the commencement of Schedule 1 (8) whether the offence to which the 
certificate relates is alleged to have been committed before or after that 
commencement. 

SCHEDULE 1—AMENDMENTS 

(Sec. 4) 

(1) Section 3 (Definitions)— 

(a) Section 3(1), definition of "cannabis resin"— 

Omit the definition, insert instead: 

"cannabis resin" means the separated resin (whether crude or 
purified) obtained from cannabis leaf, but does not include 
cannabis oil; 



3 Act No. 17 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

SCHEDULE 1— AMENDMENTS—continued 

(b) Section 3(1), definition of "discrete dosage unit"— 

Omit "Column 5", insert instead "Column 6". 

(2) Section 21 (Penalties)— 

Omit "$2,000", insert instead "20 penalty units". 

(3) Section 30 (Indictable offences punishable summarily without consent 
of accused)— 

Section 30 (3)— 

Omit the subsection, insert instead: 

(3) The penalty for an offence dealt with under this section is 
a fine of 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 2 years, or both. 

(4) Section 31 (Indictable offences punishable summarily with consent of 
accused)— 

Section 31 (3)— 

Omit the subsection, insert instead: 

(3) The penalty for an offence dealt with under this section is 
a fine of 100 penalty units or imprisonment for 2 years, or both. 

(5) Section 32 (Penalty for offences dealt with on indictment not involving 
commercial quantities)— 

Section 32 (g), (h)— 

Omit "$200,000" wherever occurring, insert instead "2,000 
penalty units". 

(6) Section 33— 

Omit the section, insert instead: 

Penalties for offences involving commercial quantities 

33. (1) This section applies to the following offences: 

(a) an offence under section 23 (2), 24 (2) or 25 (2); 

(b) an offence under section 26 of conspiring to commit an 
offence referred to in paragraph (a); 

(c) an offence under section 27 of aiding, abetting, counselling, 
procuring, soliciting or inciting the commission of an 
offence referred to in paragraph (a); 



4 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

SCHEDULE 1— AMENDMENTS—continued 

(d) an offence under section 28 of conspiring to commit, or of 
aiding, abetting, counselling or procuring the commission 
of, an offence under a law in force outside New South 
Wales which corresponds to section 23 (2), 24 (2) or 25 
(2). 

(2) The penalty for an offence is— 

(a) except as provided by paragraph (b), a fine of 3,500 
penalty units or imprisonment for 20 years, or both; or 

(b) where the offence relates to cannabis plant or cannabis leaf, 
a fine of 3,500 penalty units or imprisonment for 15 years, 
or both. 

(3) Despite subsection (2), if the court is satisfied that the 
offence involved not less than the large commercial quantity of 
the prohibited plant or prohibited drug concerned, the penalty for 
the offence is— 

(a) except as provided by paragraph (b), a fine of 5,000 
penalty units or imprisonment for life, or both; or 

(b) where the offence relates to cannabis plant or cannabis leaf, 
a fine of 5,000 penalty units or imprisonment for 20 years, 
or both. 

(4) In this section— 

"large commercial quantity", in relation to a prohibited plant 
or prohibited drug, means the number or amount, if any, 
specified opposite the plant or drug in Column 5 of 
Schedule 1. 

(7) Section 38 (Destruction of prohibited plants by Director-General)— 

Section 38 (1), definition of "Director-General"— 

Omit the definition, insert instead: 

"Director-General" means the Director-General of the 
Department of Agriculture and Fisheries. 

(8) Section 43 (Certificate evidence)— 

(a) Section 43 (1), (2)— 

Before "substance" wherever occurring, insert "plant or". 

(b) Section 43 (3)-(6)— 

Omit section 43 (3), insert instead: 

(3) Any appointed person analysing any plant submitted to the 
person may give a certificate of the result of the analysis. 



5 Act No. 17 

Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

SCHEDULE 1— AMENDMENTS—continued 

(4) In any legal proceedings under this Act, the production of 
a certificate, purporting to be signed by an appointed person, is 
prima facie evidence of— 

(a) the identity of the plant analysed; and 
(b) the quantity or mass of that plant, 

without proof of the signature or appointment of the person 
appearing to have signed the certificate, but only if the plant 
identified is cannabis plant or cannabis leaf. 

(5) The Director-General of the Department of Agriculture and 
Fisheries may appoint a person to give certificates for the purposes 
of this section if the Director-General considers the person to be 
suitably qualified. 

(6) In this section— 
"analyst" means— 

(a) any person employed by the Government of New South 
Wales as an analyst; and 

(b) any person who is an analyst within the meaning of the 
Therapeutic Goods and Cosmetics Act 1972; 

"appointed person" means a person appointed under subsection 
(5); 

"plant" includes any part of a plant, and the achene and seed 
of a plant. 

(9) Schedule 1 — 
Omit the Schedule, insert instead: 



Drug Misuse and Trafficking (Amendment) 1988 

o 
U 

E 
_3 
0 
U 

c 
E 

_3 
0 
U 

o 
CJ 

c 
U 

E 
3 
U 

OJ OO 1 —' 

h a Q 
</> o 

CO 

O S •=' 
00 CU — 
!S P C 

« C co 
- 1 C 3 

O CT 

o 

J! 

T3 3 

£ 

an
t 

ru
g 

a -j 

•a T3 
v~ 

0 C 

~ c 
r j = 

n 0 

a. a 

o 
o 

- * JKJ J * J * _ * OO 
OO V l M O O O O O O O O O J ) 1 ^ 1 ^ Oil OO 6 0 0 0 6 0 ^ " 1 6 0 6 0 6 0 6 0 J ^ 
j - : o j « i j » : j ^ ^ ^ ^ o o ^ : j » i ^ : ^ ^ o o _ i > ; ^ ^ ^ v - ) 
O O O O O O r ^ r s O O O O O p O O O O O O O O 
* N O < N * N ( N O O O O O * v > — ^ o ' v j v ! 

— (N — 
O O v i v i V i v i O 

^ O 
v i O 

OO OO 

i / i Vi 
OJ) 00 (N (N 60 

O O O O O O O O ^ ^ - - ^ 
J M i - ^ J ^ ^ v i v i O O v ! 
v i v i v i v i O O O O 

60 00 
-*J J4 OO 
in vi _*j 

60 6Q(N (N 60 60 OO 00 V> 
oo - ^ . * : — — j ^ J a i J d J ^ r s i 

o o - ^ v i v i O O v i v i v i v i — 
O v i ( N ( N O O ( N < N r ^ r - J O O O O O O r ^ O O O O ^ d o ' r s i — ' — O O — —*—i—^O 
in 

OO 00 OO OO OO 
v> vi vi vi vi 

OO —' O D O O O O O O O O O O — —" 60 60 OO 60 O D « « 60 OO OO OO A 
O O O O O O v i v i O O V i O O V i V i O O V i v i v i V i i — I 

a 

o 
d 

oo 5 

2 a 
v i o O O O O 

00 00 
V I V l 

I 00 00 00 60 O O OO O0 O0 O0 /~\ 
O O V i V i O O V i V i V i i / i t — l 

— ' o — • — —• v j o ' o O O * N ^ v J < N ( N O C ) cN (N <N (N ^ f 

00 
i n 

OO 
i n 
CN 

00 
i n 
r i 

00 O 00 BO Oil ( i 
o O o _J _> CJ — o O 

'J 

c OB 
D 

oo Q 

O O TT O O 

60 00 OO 00 OO — . 
V l 1/1 V l <n V i i—1 

r*- r- r-~ r̂  p- Q 
O O O 0 0 6 0 0 0 6 0 0 0 0 D O O 0 0 0 0 0 0 6 0 0 0 0 0 OO 60 O0 O0 A 

0 0 0 0 0 0 » ^ i r * 1 0 0 V i O O V ) V i O O V i V ) t / i V i U 1 

r n o r n r o r H v J o o o o r ^ " r n v i r ^ r ^ " o " o t ^ r ^ " r - - " r - - ' 

oo 5 °° 
v i Q v i 

_ p Q ^ q 
v i o O v i O O 

c 

£ T3 
ftj O S o 

r, •~ •a o ^n 
rs eg c n C c c u 
o •a 2? !_L 

a 0 8 E 

o o o o _-*;• 
o o o o = 

< < < < < <
a<a 

_ c 
•a St; • 
CO > i 

J3 -C P 

E £ 
CO CO 

< < 

in
e 

(3
-b

en
zy

lm
or

ph
in

e)
 

a. 

, a.Z-5 £ 
x: x: o. N N a a p c c 
_ — C O O 

< < < CQ m 

o 
•a 

a •= •= E E 
CO CO CO CO CO 

o o o o ~ 

a 
E 
o 

c 
E 
c 
• — 

m 
C Q 0 Q C Q C Q Q 2 C Q C Q T f 



S
C

H
E

D
U

L
E

 
I—

co
nt

in
ue

d 

Pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
pl

an
t 

or
 

pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
dr

ug
 

C
ol

um
n  

1 
C

ol
um

n 
2 

C
ol

um
n 

3 
C

ol
um

n 
4 

C
ol

um
n 

5 
C

ol
um

n 
6 

T
ra

ff
ic

ka
bl

e 
S

m
al

l 
In

di
ct

ab
le

 
C

om
m

er
ci

al
 

L
ar

ge
 

D
is

cr
et

e 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
co

m
m

er
ci

al
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
do

sa
ge

 
un

it
 (

D
D

U
) 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

01
25

kg
 

0.
05

kg
 

0.
00

5g
 

or
 

or
 

or
 

0.
07

5g
 

0.
02

g 
0.

12
5g

 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
50

0.
0g

 
2.

0k
g 

0.
2g

 
or

 
or

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

30
0.

0g
 

30
.0

g 
lO

O
O

.O
g 

25
.0

kg
 

10
0.

0k
g 

—
 

5.
0g

 
2.

0g
 

lO
.O

g 
50

0.
0g

 
2.

0k
g 

—
 

—
 

5 
50

 
25

0 
10

00
 

—
 

30
.0

g 
5.

0g
 

90
.0

g 
2.

5k
g 

10
.0

kg
 

—
 

3.
0g

 
l.O

g 
5.

0g
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

—
 

V
-5

g 
2.

5g
 

12
.5

g 
1.

25
kg

 
5.

0k
g 

—
 

3.
0g

 
l.O

g 
5.

0g
 

25
0.

0g
 

1.
0k

g 
—

 

15
.0

g 
5.

0g
 

25
.0

g 
2.

5k
g 

10
.0

kg
 

—
 

15
.0

g 
5.

0g
 

25
.0

g 
2.

5k
g 

10
.0

kg
 

—
 

15
.0

g 
5.

0g
 

25
.0

g 
2.

5k
g 

10
.0

kg
 

—
 

3.
0g

 
l.O

g 
5.

0g
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

—
 

3.
0g

 
l.O

g 
5.

0g
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

—
 

7.
5g

 
2.

5g
 

12
.5

g 
1.

25
kg

 
5.

0k
g 

—
 

7-
5g

 
2.

5g
 

12
.5

g 
1.

25
kg

 
5.

0k
g 

—
 

3.
0g

 
l.O

g 
5.

0g
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

—
 

3-
B

ro
m

o-
4-

m
et

ho
xy

am
ph

et
am

in
e 

. 

B
uf

ot
en

in
e 

an
d 

its
 d

er
iv

at
iv

es
 b

ei
ng

 t
ho

se
 

de
ri

va
ti

ve
s 

ha
vi

ng
 

ha
ll

uc
in

og
en

ic
 

pr
op

er
tie

s 

C
an

na
bi

s 
le

af
 

C
an

na
bi

s 
oi

l 
C

an
na

bi
s 

pl
an

t 
C

an
na

bi
s 

re
si

n 
C

at
hi

no
ne

 
C

lo
ni

ta
ze

ne
 

C
oc

ai
ne

 
C

od
ei

ne
 

ex
ce

pt
 

w
he

re
 

Sc
he

du
le

 
T

w
o 

or
 

Fo
ur

 o
f 

th
e 

Po
is

on
s 

L
is

t 
ap

pl
ie

s 
C

od
ei

ne
-N

-o
xi

de
 

C
od

ox
im

c 
D

es
om

or
ph

in
e 

D
cx

ir
om

or
am

id
c 

D
ia

m
or

ph
in

e-
se

e 
he

ro
in

 
D

ia
m

pr
om

id
e 

D
ie

th
yl

th
ia

m
bu

te
ne

 
N

iN
-D

ie
th

yl
tr

yp
ta

m
in

e 
D

if
en

ox
in

 
ex

ce
pt

 w
he

re
 S

ch
ed

ul
e 

Fo
ur

 o
f 

th
e 

Po
is

on
s 

L
is

t 
ap

pl
ie

s 
0.

6g
 

0.
2g

 
l.O

g 
0.

1 
kg

 
0.

4k
g 



SC
H

E
D

U
L

E
 I

—
co

nt
in

ue
d 

Pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
pl

an
t 

or
 

pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
dr

ug
 

C
ol

um
n 

1 
C

ol
um

n 
2 

C
ol

um
n 

3 
C

ol
um

n 
4 

C
ol

um
n 

5 
C

ol
um

n 
6 

T
ra

ff
ic

ka
bl

e 
S

m
al

l 
In

di
ct

ab
le

 
C

om
m

er
ci

al
 

L
ar

ge
 

D
is

cr
et

e 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
co

m
m

er
ci

al
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
do

sa
ge

 
un

it
 

(D
D

U
) 

15
.0

g 
5.

0g
 

25
.0

g 
2.

5k
g 

10
.0

kg
 

15
.0

g 
5.

0g
 

25
.0

g 
2.

5k
g 

10
.0

kg
 

—
 

15
.0

g 
5.

0g
 

25
.0

g 
2.

5k
g 

10
.0

kg
 

—
 

15
.0

g 
5.

0g
 

25
.0

g 
2.

5k
g 

10
.0

kg
 

—
 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 

D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

0.
2g

 
or

 
or

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5 
kg

 
2.

0k
g 

0.
2g

 
or

 
or

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 

D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

0.
2g

 
or

 
or

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

or
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
0.

8g
 

5.
0g

 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

or
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
0.

8g
 

5.
0g

 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

or
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
0.

8g
 

5.
0g

 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

or
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
0.

8g
 

5.
0g

 

D
ih

yd
ro

co
de

in
e 

ex
ce

pt
 

w
he

re
 

Sc
he

du
le

 
T

w
o 

or
 F

ou
r 

of
 t

he
 P

oi
so

ns
 L

is
t 

ap
pl

ie
s 

D
ih

yd
ro

m
or

ph
in

e 
D

im
en

ox
ad

ol
 

D
im

ep
he

pt
an

ol
 

2.
4-

D
im

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e 

2.
5-

D
im

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e 

3.
4-

D
im

ct
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e 

3.
4-

D
im

et
ho

xy
-5

-c
th

ox
ya

m
ph

et
am

in
e 

2.
5-

D
im

et
ho

xy
-4

-e
th

ox
ya

m
ph

et
am

in
e 

4.
5-

D
im

et
ho

xy
-2

-e
th

ox
ya

m
ph

et
am

in
e 

2.
5-

D
im

et
ho

xy
-4

-e
th

yl
am

ph
et

am
in

c 



SC
H

E
D

U
L

E
 1

—
co

nt
in

ue
d 

P
ro

hi
bi

te
d 

pl
an

t 
or

 
pr

oh
ib

it
ed

 
dr

ug
 

C
ol

um
n 

1 
C

ol
um

n 
2 

C
ol

um
n 

3 
C

ol
um

n 
4 

C
ol

um
n 

5 
C

ol
um

n 
6 

T
ra

ff
ic

ka
bl

e 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

S
m

al
l 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
In

di
ct

ab
le

 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

C
om

m
er

ci
al

 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

L
ar

ge
 

co
m

m
er

ci
al

 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

D
is

cr
et

e 
do

sa
ge

 
un

it
 

(D
D

U
) 

2.
5-

D
im

et
ho

xy
-4

-m
et

hy
la

m
ph

et
am

in
e 

an
d 

ot
he

r 
su

bs
ta

nc
es

 
st

ru
ct

ur
al

ly
 

de
ri

ve
d 

fr
om

 
m

et
ho

xy
ph

en
yl

et
hy

la
m

in
e 

be
in

g 
th

os
e 

su
bs

ta
nc

es
 

ha
vi

ng
 

ha
ll

uc
in

og
en

ic
 

pr
op

er
ti

es
 

15
 D

D
U

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

D
im

et
hy

lt
hi

am
bu

te
ne

 
30

.0
g 

2
.3

-D
im

et
h

o
x

y
-4

.5
-

m
et

hy
le

ne
di

ox
ya

m
ph

et
am

in
e 

..
..

..
..

. 
15

 D
D

U
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
2

.5
-D

ir
n

et
h

o
x

y
-3

,4
-

m
et

hy
le

ne
di

ox
ya

m
ph

et
am

in
e 

15
 D

D
U

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

3.
4-

D
im

et
ho

xy
ph

en
yl

et
hy

la
m

in
e 

15
 D

D
U

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

3-
(1

.2
-D

im
et

hy
lh

ep
ty

l)
-l

-h
yd

ro
xy

-7
,8

,9
,1

0-
te

tr
ah

v
d

ro
-6

.6
.9

-l
ri

m
et

h
y

l-
6

H
-d

ib
en

zo
 

(b
.d

)p
yr

an
 

15
 D

D
U

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

N
:N

-D
im

et
h

y
lt

ry
p

ta
m

in
e 

an
d 

it
s 

d
er

iv
at

iv
es

 
b

ei
n

g 
th

o
se

 
d

er
iv

at
iv

es
 

ha
vi

ng
 h

al
lu

ci
no

ge
ni

c 
pr

op
er

ti
es

 
15

 D
D

U
 

or
 

3.
0g

 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

or
 

or
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

O
.O

g 
50

.0
g 

5.
0k

g 
20

.0
kg

 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

or
 

or
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

or
 

or
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

or
 

or
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

cr
 

or
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

or
 

or
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

0.
2g

 

0.
2g

 

0.
2g

 

0.
2g

 

0.
2g

 

0.
2g

 



SC
H

E
D

U
L

E
 1

—
co

nt
in

ue
d 

C
ol

um
n 

1 
C

ol
um

n 
2 

C
ol

um
n 

3 
C

ol
um

n 
4 

C
ol

um
n 

5 
C

ol
um

n 
6 

Pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
pl

an
t 

or
 

pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
dr

ug
 

Tr
af

lfi
ck

ab
le

 
qu

an
tit

y 
Sm

al
l 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
In

di
ct

ab
le

 
qu

an
tit

y 
C

om
m

er
ci

al
 

qu
an

tit
y 

L
ar

ge
 

co
m

m
er

ci
al

 
qu

an
tit

y 

D
is

cr
et

e 
do

sa
ge

 
un

it 
(D

D
U

) 

D
io

xa
ph

et
yl

 b
ut

yr
at

e 
3.

0g
 

D
ip

he
no

xy
la

te
 e

xc
ep

t 
w

he
re

 S
ch

ed
ul

e 
Fo

ur
 

of
 t

he
 P

oi
so

ns
 L

is
t 

ap
pl

ie
s 

3.
0g

 
D

ip
ip

an
on

e 
15

.0
g 

E
cg

on
in

e.
 i

ts
 e

st
er

s 
an

d 
de

ri
va

tiv
es

 w
hi

ch
 

ar
e 

co
nv

er
tib

le
 t

o 
ec

go
ni

ne
 a

nd
 c

oc
ai

ne
 

15
.0

g 
4.

5-
E

th
yl

en
ed

io
xy

-3
-m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e 
15

 D
D

U
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
E

th
yl

m
et

hy
lth

ia
m

bu
te

ne
 

15
.0

g 
E

th
yl

m
or

ph
in

e 
ex

ce
pt

 w
he

re
 S

ch
ed

ul
e 

T
w

o 
or

 F
ou

r 
of

 t
he

 P
oi

so
ns

 L
is

t 
ap

pl
ie

s 
. 

3.
0g

 
E

lo
ni

ta
ze

ne
 

7.
5g

 
E

to
rp

hi
ne

 
7.

5g
 

E
to

xe
ri

di
ne

 
7.

5g
 

Fe
ne

ty
lli

ne
 

3.
0g

 
Fe

nt
an

yl
 

0.
00

75
g 

Fu
re

th
id

in
e 

1.5
g 

H
er

oi
n 

3.
0g

 
3-

H
ex

yl
-1

 -
hy

dr
ox

y-
7,

8,
9,

10
-t

et
ra

hy
dr

o-
6.

6.
9-

tr
im

et
hy

l-
6H

-d
ib

en
zo

 (
b.

d)
py

ra
n 

. 
15

 D
D

U
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
H

yd
ro

co
do

ne
 

3.
0g

 
H

yd
ro

m
or

ph
in

ol
 

3.
0g

 
H

yd
ro

m
or

ph
on

e 
3.

0g
 

H
yd

ro
xy

pe
th

id
in

e 
7.

5g
 

K
et

ob
em

id
on

e 
3.

0g
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

l.O
g 

5.
0g

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
5.

0g
 

25
.0

g 
2.

5k
g 

10
.0

kg
 

5.
0g

 
25

.0
g 

2.
5k

g 
10

.0
kg

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 

D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

or
 

or
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

5.
0g

 
25

.0
g 

2.
5k

g 
10

.0
kg

 

l.O
g 

5.
0g

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
2.

5g
 

12
.5

g 
1.

25
kg

 
5.

0k
g 

2.
5g

 
12

.5
g 

1.
25

kg
 

5.
0k

g 
2.

5g
 

12
.5

g 
1.

25
kg

 
5.

0k
g 

l.O
g 

5.
0g

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

00
25

g 
0.

01
25

g 
0.

00
12

5k
g 

0.
00

5k
g 

0.
5g

 
2.

5g
 

0.
25

kg
 

1.
0k

g 
l.O

g 
5.

0g
 

25
0.

0g
 

1.
0k

g 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

or
 

or
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

l.O
g 

5.
0g

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
l.O

g 
5.

0g
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

l.O
g 

5.
0g

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
5.

0g
 

12
.5

g 
1.

25
kg

 
5.

0k
g 

l.O
g 

5.
0g

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 

0.
2g

 

0.
2g

 



S
C

H
E

D
U

L
E

 
1—

 c
on

ti
nu

ed
 

C
ol

um
n 

I 
C

ol
um

n 
2 

C
ol

um
n 

3 
C

ol
um

n 
4 

C
ol

um
n 

5 
C

ol
um

n 
6 

P
ro

hi
bi

te
d 

pl
an

t 
o

r  
T

ra
ff

ic
ka

bl
e 

pr
oh

ib
it

ed
 d

ru
g 

qu
an

ti
ty

 

L
ev

or
ph

an
ol

 
1.

5g
 

L
ys

er
gi

c 
ac

id
 a

nd
 i

ts
 d

er
iv

at
iv

es
 b

ei
ng

 t
ho

se
 

d
er

iv
at

iv
es

 
h

av
in

g 
h

al
lu

ci
n

o
g

en
ic

 
pr

op
er

ti
es

 
15

 D
D

L
) 

o
r 

0.
00

3g
 

L
ys

er
gi

de
 

an
d 

it
s 

de
ri

va
ti

ve
s 

be
in

g 
th

os
e 

d
er

iv
at

iv
es

 
h

av
in

g 
h

al
lu

ci
n

o
g

en
ic

 
pr

op
er

ti
es

 
15

 D
D

U
 

or
 

0.
00

3g
 

M
es

ca
li

ne
 a

nd
 o

th
er

 s
ub

st
an

ce
s 

st
ru

ct
ur

al
ly

 
de

ri
ve

d 
fr

om
 

m
et

ho
xy

ph
en

yl
et

hy
la

m
in

e 
ha

vi
ng

 h
al

lu
ci

no
ge

ni
c 

pr
op

er
ti

es
 

15
 D

D
U

 
or

 
11

.2
5g

 
M

et
az

oc
in

e 
10

.5
g 

M
et

ha
do

ne
 

3.
0g

 

4-
M

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e 
15

 D
D

U
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
4-

M
et

ho
xy

m
et

hy
la

m
ph

et
am

in
e 

15
 D

D
U

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

2
-M

et
h

o
x

y
-3

.4
-

m
et

hy
le

ne
di

ox
ya

m
ph

et
am

in
e 

15
 D

D
U

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

S
m

al
l 

In
di

ct
ab

le
 

C
om

m
er

ci
al

 
L

ar
ge

 
D

is
cr

et
e 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
co

m
m

er
ci

al
 

do
sa

ge
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
un

it
 

(D
D

U
) 

0.
5g

 
2.

5g
 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 
D

D
U

 
or

 
or

 
0.

00
08

g 
0.

00
5g

 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

or
 

or
 

0.
00

08
g 

0.
00

5g
 

4 
D

D
U

 
50

 D
D

U
 

or
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
1

8
.7

5
B

 

3.
5g

 
17

.5
g 

l.O
g 

5.
0g

 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 
D

D
U

 
or

 
or

 
0.

8g
 

5.
0g

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
or

 
or

 
0.

8g
 

5.
0g

 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

or
 

or
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

0.
25

kg
 

1.
87

5k
g 

1.
75

kg
 

0.
5k

g 
0.

5k
g 

0.
5k

g 

0.
5k

g 

1.
0k

g 

0.
00

05
kg

 
0.

00
2k

g 

7.
5k

g 

7.
0k

g 
2.

0k
g 

2.
0k

g 

:.
0k
g 

2.
0k
g 

0.
00
02
 

0.
00
05
kg
 

0.
00
2k
g 

0.
00
02
g 

0.
75
g
 

0.
2?
 

0.
2g
 

0.
2g
 



S
C

H
E

D
U

L
E

 
I—

co
nt

in
ue

d 

Pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
pl

an
t 

or
 

pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
dr

ug
 

C
ol

um
n 

1 
C

ol
um

n 
2 

C
ol

um
n 

3 
C

ol
um

n 
4 

C
ol

um
n 

5 
C

ol
um

n 
6 

T
ra

fn
ck

ab
le

 
S

m
al

l 
In

di
ct

ab
le

 
C

om
m

er
ci

al
 

L
ar

ge
 

D
is

cr
et

e 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
co

m
m

er
ci

al
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
do

sa
ge

 
un

it
 

(D
D

U
) 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
or

 
0.

8g
 

or
 

5.
0g

 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
or

 
0.

8g
 

or
 

5.
0g

 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
or

 
0.

8g
 

or
 

5.
0g

 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
or

 
0.

8g
 

or
 

5.
0g

 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
15

 D
D

U
 

or
 

0.
8g

 
4 

D
D

U
 

or
 

5.
0g

 
25

 
D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
3.

0g
 

3.
0g

 
3.

0g
 

0.
75

g 
0.

75
g 

0.
00

75
g 

or
 

0.
8g

 
l.O

g 
l.O

g 
l.O

g 
0.

25
g 

0.
25

g 
0.

00
25

g 

or
 

5.
0g

 
5.

0g
 

5.
0g

 
5.

0g
 

1.
25

g 
1.

25
g 

0.
01

25
g 

0.
25

kg
 

0.
5k

g 
0.

5k
g 

0.
12

5k
g 

0.
12

5k
g 

0.
00

12
5k

g 

1.
0k

g 
2.

0k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

5k
g 

0.
5k

g 
0.

00
5k

g 

—
 

2-
M

et
ho

xy
-4

,5
-

m
ct

hy
le

nc
di

ox
ya

m
ph

et
am

in
c 

3-
M

et
ho

xy
-4

,5
-

m
et

hy
le

ne
di

ox
ya

m
ph

et
am

in
e 

4
-M

e
th

o
xy

-2
,3

-
m

et
hy

lc
ne

di
ox

ya
m

ph
et

am
in

e 

2
-M

e
th

o
xy

-3
,4

-
m

et
hy

le
ne

di
ox

yp
he

ny
le

th
yl

am
in

e 
. .

 . 
. 

3-
M

et
ho

xy
-4

.5
-

m
et

hy
le

ne
di

ox
yp

he
ny

le
th

yl
am

in
e 

4-
M

el
ho

xy
ph

en
yl

et
hy

la
m

in
e 

M
et

hy
la

m
ph

et
am

in
e 

M
et

hy
ld

es
or

ph
in

e 
M

et
hy

ld
ih

yd
ro

m
or

ph
in

e 
3.

 4
-M

et
hy

le
ne

di
ox

ya
m

ph
et

am
in

e 
3.

 4
-M

ct
hy

le
ne

di
ox

ym
et

hy
la

m
ph

et
am

in
e 

3-
M

el
hy

lf
en

ta
ny

l 



S
C

H
E

D
U

L
E

 
l—

co
nt

in
ue

d 

C
ol

um
n 

1 
C

ol
um

n 
2 

C
ol

um
n 

3 
C

ol
um

n 
4 

( 
nl

ui
nn

 
i 

C
ol

um
n 

6 
P

ro
hi

bi
te

d 
pl

an
t 

or
 

pr
oh

ib
it

ed
 

dr
ug

 
T

ra
ff

ic
ka

bl
e 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
S

m
al

l 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

In
di

ct
ab

le
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
C

om
m

er
ci

al
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
L

ar
ge

 
co

m
m

er
ci

al
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 

D
is

cr
et

e 
do

sa
ge

 
un

it
 

(D
D

U
) 

M
ct

hy
lp

he
ni

da
te

 
l-

M
et

hy
l-

4-
ph

en
yl

-4
-p

ro
pi

on
ox

yp
ip

er
id

in
e 

3-
M

et
hy

lt
hi

of
en

ta
ny

l 
M

et
op

on
 

M
on

oa
ce

ty
lm

or
ph

in
e 

6
-M

o
n

o
ac

et
y

lm
o

rp
h

in
e 

an
d 

o
th

er
 

ac
et

yl
at

ed
 

de
ri

va
ti

ve
s 

of
 

m
or

ph
in

e 
M

or
ph

er
id

in
e 

M
or

ph
in

e 
M

or
ph

in
e-

N
-o

xi
de

 
M

yr
o

p
h

in
e 

N
ic

oc
od

in
e 

ex
ce

pt
 w

he
re

 S
ch

ed
ul

e 
T

w
o 

or
 

F
ou

r 
of

 t
he

 P
oi

so
ns

 L
is

t 
ap

pl
ie

s 
N

ic
od

ic
od

in
e 

ex
ce

pt
 

w
he

re
 

S
ch

ed
ul

e 
T

w
o 

or
 F

ou
r 

of
 t

he
 P

oi
so

ns
 L

is
t 

ap
pl

ie
s 

N
ic

o
m

o
rp

h
in

e 
N

or
ac

yl
m

et
ha

do
l 

N
or

co
de

in
e 

ex
ce

pt
 w

he
re

 S
ch

ed
ul

e 
T

w
o 

or
 

F
o

u
r 

of
 t

he
 P

oi
so

ns
 L

is
t 

ap
pl

ie
s 

N
or

le
vo

rp
ha

no
l 

N
o

rm
et

h
ad

o
n

e 
N

o
rm

o
rp

h
in

e 
N

or
pi

pa
no

ne
 

O
p

iu
m

 
O

p
iu

m
, 

pr
ep

ar
ed

 
O

xy
co

do
ne

 
O

x
y

m
o

rp
h

o
n

c 
P

ar
af

lu
ro

fe
nt

an
vl

 

3.
0g

 
15

.0
g 

0.
00

75
g 

3.
0g

 
3.

0g
 

3.
0g

 
3.

0g
 

3.
0g

 
3.

0g
 

30
.0

g 

3.
0g

 

3.
0g

 
3.

0g
 

3.
0g

 

3.
0g

 
3.

0g
 

7-
5g

 
30

.0
g 

15
.0

g 
30

.0
g 

30
.0

g 
7.

5g
 

3.
0g

 
0.

00
75

g 

l.O
g 

5.
0g

 
O

.0
02

5g
 

l.O
g 

l.O
g 

l.O
g 

l.O
g 

l.O
g 

l.O
g 

lO
.O

g 

l.O
g 

l.O
g 

l.O
g 

2.
5g

 
lO

.O
g 

5.
0g

 
lO

.O
g 

lO
.O

g 
2.

5g
 

l.O
g 

0.
00

25
g 

5.
0g

 
25

.0
g 

0.
01

25
g 

5.
0g

 
5.

0g
 

5.
0g

 
5.

0g
 

5.
0g

 
5.

0g
 

50
.0

g 

5.
0g

 

5.
0g

 
5.

0g
 

5.
0g

 

5.
0g

 
5.

0g
 

12
.5

g 
50

.0
g 

25
.0

g 
50

.0
g 

50
.0

g 
12

.5
g 

5.
0g

 
0.

01
25

g 

0.
5k

g 
2.

5k
g 

0.
00

12
5k

g 
0.

5k
g 

0.
25

kg
 

0.
25

kg
 

0.
5k

g 
0.

25
kg

 
0.

25
kg

 
5.

0k
g 

0.
5k

g 

0.
5k

g 
0.

5k
g 

0.
5k

g 

0.
5k

g 
0.

5k
g 

1.
25

kg
 

5.
0k

g 
2.

5k
g 

1.
0k

g 
1.

0k
g 

1.
25

kg
 

0.
5k

g 
0.

00
12

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
10

.0
kg

 
0.

00
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

1.
0k

g 

1.
0k

g 
2.

0k
g 

1.
0k

g 
1.

0k
g 

20
.0

kg
 

2.
0k

g 

2.
0k

g 
2.

0k
g 

2.
0k

g 

2.
0k

g 
2.

0k
g 

5.
0k

g 
20

.0
kg

 
10

.0
kg

 
4.

0k
g 

4.
0k

g 
5.

0k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

00
5K

g 



SC
H

E
D

U
L

E
 1

—
co

nt
in

ue
d 

Pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
pl

an
t 

or
 

pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
dr

ug
 

C
ol

um
n 

1 
C

ol
um

n 
2 

C
ol

um
n 

3 
C

ol
um

n 
4 

C
ol

um
n 

5 
C

ol
um

n 
6 

T
ra

ff
ic

ka
bl

e 
S

m
al

l 
In

di
ct

ab
le

 
C

om
m

er
ci

al
 

L
ar

ge
 

D
is

cr
et

e 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
co

m
m

er
ci

al
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
do

sa
ge

 
un

it
 

(D
D

U
) 

3.
0g

 
l.O

g 
5.

0g
 

0.
25

kg
 

1.
0k

g 
—

 
15

.0
g 

5.
0g

 
25

.0
g 

2.
5k

g 
10

.0
kg

 
—

 
15

.0
g 

5.
0g

 
25

.0
g 

2.
5k

g 
10

.0
kg

 
—

 
1

5
g 

0.
5g

 
2.

5g
 

0.
25

kg
 

1.
0k

g 
—

 
3.

0g
 

l.O
g 

5.
0g

 
25

0.
0g

 
1.

0k
g 

—
 

7.
5g

 
2.

5g
 

12
.5

g 
1.

25
kg

 
5.

0k
g 

—
 

7.
5g

 
2.

5g
 

I2
.5

g 
1.

25
kg

 
5.

0k
g 

—
 

7.
5g

 
2.

5g
 

12
.5

g 
1.

25
kg

 
5.

0k
g 

—
 

1.
5g

 
0.

5g
 

2.
5g

 
0.

25
kg

 
1.

0k
g 

—
 

15
.0

g 
5.

0g
 

25
.0

g 
2.

5k
g 

10
.0

kg
 

—
 

7.
5g

 
2.

5g
 

12
.5

g 
1.

25
kg

 
5.

0k
g 

—
 

I5
.0

g 
5.

0g
 

25
.0

g 
2.

5k
g 

10
.0

kg
 

—
 

1
5

g 
0.

5g
 

2.
5g

 
0.

25
kg

 
1.

0k
g 

—
 

l.
5g

 
0.

5g
 

2.
5g

 
0.

25
kg

 
1.

0k
g 

—
 

—
 

5 
50

 
25

0 
10

00
 

—
 

37
.5

g 
12

.5
g 

62
.5

g 
6.

25
kg

 
25

.0
kg

 
—

 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
25

.0
g 

lO
O

.O
g 

O
.O

lg
 

or
 

or
 

or
 

0.
07

5g
 

0.
04

g 
0.

25
g 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
25

.0
g 

lO
O

.O
g 

O
.O

lg
 

or
 

or
 

or
 

0.
15

g 
0.

04
g 

0.
25

g 
3.

0g
 

l.O
g 

5.
0g

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
—

 

P
et

hi
di

ne
 

Ph
en

ad
ox

on
e 

Ph
en

am
pr

om
id

e 
Ph

en
az

oc
in

c 
Ph

cn
cy

cl
id

in
e 

Ph
en

di
m

ct
ra

zi
ne

 
Ph

en
m

et
ra

zi
ne

 
Ph

en
om

or
ph

an
 

Ph
en

op
cr

id
in

e 
l-

Ph
en

yl
et

hy
l-

4-
ac

et
ox

yp
ip

er
id

in
e 

. 
. 

Ph
ol

co
di

ne
 e

xc
ep

t 
w

he
re

 S
ch

ed
ul

e 
T

w
o 

or
 

Fo
ur

 o
f 

th
e 

Po
is

on
s 

L
is

t 
ap

pl
ie

s 
Pi

m
in

od
in

e 
Pi

ri
tr

am
id

e 
P

ro
he

pt
az

in
e 

Pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
pl

an
t, 

ot
he

r 
th

an
 c

an
na

bi
s 

pl
an

t 
Pr

op
er

id
in

e 
Ps

ilo
ci

n 
an

d 
its

 
de

ri
va

tiv
es

 
be

in
g 

th
os

e 
de

ri
va

ti
ve

s 
ha

vi
ng

 
ha

ll
uc

in
og

en
ic

 
pr

op
er

tie
s 

Ps
ilo

cy
bi

n 
an

d 
its

 d
er

iv
at

iv
es

 b
ei

ng
 t

ho
se

 
de

ri
va

ti
ve

s 
ha

vi
ng

 
ha

ll
uc

in
og

en
ic

 
pr

op
er

tie
s 

T
et

ra
hv

dr
oc

an
na

bi
no

l 



S
C

H
E

D
U

L
E

 
I—

co
nt

in
ue

d 

Pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
pl

an
t 

or
 

pr
oh

ib
ite

d 
dr

ug
 

2.
3.

4.
5-

T
et

ra
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e 

T
he

ba
co

n 
T

he
ba

in
e 

T
hi

of
cn

ta
ny

l 
T

ri
m

ep
er

id
in

e 
2.

3.
4-

T
ri

m
et

ho
xy

am
ph

et
am

in
e 

2.
3.

5-
T

ri
m

ct
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e 

2.
3.

6-
T

ri
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e 

2.
4.

5-
T

ri
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e 

2.
4.

6-
T

ri
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e 

3.
4.

5-
T

ri
m

et
ho

xy
am

ph
et

am
in

e 

l-
(3

.4
.5

-T
ri

m
et

ho
xy

ph
en

yl
)-

2-
am

in
ob

ut
am

e 

2.
4.

5-
T

ri
m

et
ho

xy
ph

en
yl

et
hy

la
m

in
e 

. 

C
ol

um
n 

1 
C

ol
um

n 
2 

C
ol

um
n 

3 
C

ol
um

n 
4 

C
ol

um
n 

5 
C

ol
um

n 
6 

T
ra

ff
ic

ka
bl

e 
S

m
al

l 
In

di
ct

ab
le

 
C

om
m

er
ci

al
 

L
ar

ge
 

D
is

cr
et

e 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
qu

an
ti

ty
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
co

m
m

er
ci

al
 

qu
an

ti
ty

 
do

sa
ge

 
un

it
 

(D
D

U
) 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

or
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
0.

8g
 

5.
0g

 
3.

0g
 

l.O
g 

5.
0g

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
—

 
3.

0g
 

I.O
g 

5.
0g

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
—

 
0.

00
75

g 
0.

00
25

g 
O

.0
12

5g
 

0.
00

12
5k

g 
0.

00
5 

kg
 

—
 

15
.0

g 
5.

0g
 

25
.0

g 
2.

5k
g 

10
.0

kg
 

—
 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

or
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
0.

8g
 

5.
0g

 
15

 D
D

U
 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

0.
2g

 
or

 
or

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

01
 

or
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
0.

8g
 

5.
0g

 
15

 D
D

U
 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

0.
2g

 
or

 
or

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

or
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
0.

8g
 

5.
0g

 
15

 D
D

U
 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

0.
2g

 
or

 
or

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

• 
15

 D
D

U
 

4 
D

D
U

 
25

 D
D

U
 

0.
5k

g 
2.

0k
g 

0.
2g

 
or

 
or

 
or

 
3.

0g
 

0.
8g

 
5.

0g
 

15
 D

D
U

 
4 

D
D

U
 

25
 D

D
U

 
0.

5k
g 

2.
0k

g 
0.

2g
 

or
 

or
 

or
 

3.
0g

 
0.

8g
 

5.
0g

 


